
Sky Bhavsar <skybhavsar@gmail.com>

Fwd: Your order#HHLI-28757 on https://www.jci-hitachi.in is successful. 
1 message

Nisarg Shah <shahnicks123456@gmail.com> Fri, Apr 20, 2018 at 5:56 PM
To: skybhavsar@gmail.com

 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: orders@ccavenue.com 
Date: 20-Apr-2018 5:41 PM 
Subject: Your order#HHLI-28757 on https://www.jci-hitachi.in is successful. 
To: anand_panchal@hitachi-hirel.com 
Cc:  
 

JCH-IN e-Shop

Dear Ronak, 
 
Thank you for your order from https://www.jci-hitachi.in 
 
For your convenience, we have included a copy of your order below. The charge will appear on your credit card / Account Statement
as 'www.ccavenue.com' 
 
 

Order# CCAvenue Reference # Order Date

HHLI-28757 107359177438 20/04/2018 17:41:54

 
 
Billing Details
 

Customer: Ronak  |  anand_panchal@hitachi-
hirel.com  |  8141336229

Address: A-18 Parasprabhu society, opp. Vishalnagar Isanpur
,Gujarat ,Ahmedabad 382443. India

Customer IP: 43.243.39.133

Pay Mode: Debit Card - Visa Debit Card

Bank Ref #: 174138

Instructions:

Order Amount: INR 28890.00

Net Payable: INR 28890.00

 
 
Shipping Details
 

Contact Person: Akash  |  9173610495

Address: 1/56,Khodiyar nagar near,National Highway no-8,bapunagar, Gujarat, Ahmedabad 382350. India
 
 
CUSTOMER CARE 
http://www.hitachi-hli.com 
Email : eshop@jci-hitachi.com 
Contact Info : 011-26991362

 
 
 
 
--  

mailto:orders@ccavenue.com
https://www.jci-hitachi.in/
mailto:anand_panchal@hitachi-hirel.com
https://www.jci-hitachi.in/
https://www.jci-hitachi.in/
http://www.ccavenue.com/
mailto:anand_panchal@hitachi-hirel.com
https://maps.google.com/?q=1/56,Khodiyar+nagar&entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.hitachi-hli.com/
mailto:eshop@jci-hitachi.com


Nisarg Shah 
 


